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SUBJECT: Commanding General's Anti-Harassment Policy Statement 

1. I want to emphasize the importance of maintaining a work environment free of all
workplace harassment. Our mission can be accomplished only with the support of every
member of our organization working to their fullest potential in a professional
environment free from any unlawful discrimination or harassment.

2. Workplace harassment is defined as unwelcome conduct based on an individual's
protected group when submission to such conduct is made either explicitly or implicitly
as a term or condition of employment. I am committed to the principles of equal
employment opportunity and must ensure workplace policies, practices, and behaviors
are fair, professional, and non-discriminatory. Workplace harassment is inconsistent
with good order and discipline and has a negative impact on the mission and morale. I
charge all commanders, leaders, managers, and supervisors at every level with
maintain an environment free of any form of harassment. Harassing conduct tears at the
very fiber of our Army Values, therefore I expect all Army Medicine personnel to act
professionally, comply with this policy and refrain from any harassing conduct.

3. Leaders at all levels must be vigilant in identifying inappropriate harassing behavior
and work aggressively to eradicate it before it becomes severe or pervasive and
violates law. This includes both sexual and non-sexual harassment. We must ensure
workplace policies, practices and behaviors are fair, professional, and non­
discriminatory. Leaders must understand their role and responsibilities and act on all
harassment complaints in accordance with AR 690-12, Equal Employment Opportunity
and Diversity, Appendix D (reference e, above).

4. Any U.S. Army Medical Command (MEDCOM) employee who believes that he or she
has been the victim of harassment is encouraged to report it. Immediate reporting can
help to bring about timely resolution to problem situations and assist management in

"This policy supersedes OTSG/MEDCOM Policy Memo 22-038, 9 December 2022, subject: Commanding General's Anti­
Harassment Policy. 
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